
Floor Packet Page No. 287

Amend CSHB 1 as follows:

(1.) In Article III, page III-57, Strategy A.1.1 System

Office Operations of the bill pattern for The University of Texas

System Administration, decrease the general revenue appropriation

by $365,000 in each year of the biennium and adjust the totals

accordingly.

(2.) In Article III, page III-58, Rider 2, Appropriation,

Governing Board, under the appropriation to The University of Texas

System Administration, strike the amount "$450,000" and substitute

the amount "$85,000".

(3.) In Article III, page III-76, Strategy A.3.1 System

Office Operations of the bill pattern for the Texas A&M University

System Administrative and General Offices, decrease the general

revenue appropriation by $240,000 in each year of the biennium and

adjust the totals accordingly.

(4.) In Article III, page III-77, Rider 1, Appropriation,

Governing Board, under the appropriation to the Texas A&M

University System Administrative and General Offices, strike the

amount "$325,000" and substitute the amount "$85,000".

(3.) In Article III, page III-95, Strategy A.1.1 System

Office Operations of the bill pattern for the University of Houston

System Administration, decrease the general revenue appropriation

by $65,000 in each year of the biennium and adjust the totals

accordingly.

(4.) In Article III, page III-95, Rider 1, Appropriation,

Governing Board, under the appropriation to the University of

Houston System Administration, strike the amount "$150,000" and

substitute the amount "$85,000".

(5.) In Article III, page III-111, Strategy A.1.1 System

Office Operations of the bill pattern for the Texas Tech University

System Administration, decrease the general revenue appropriation

by $40,000 in each year of the biennium and adjust the totals

accordingly.

(6.) In Article III, page III-112, Rider 1, Appropriation,

Governing Board, under the appropriation to the Texas Tech

1



University System Administration, strike the amount "$125,000" and

substitute the amount "$85,000".

(6.) In Article III, page III-31, Strategy A.3.1 Active

Health of the bill pattern for the Teacher Retirement System,

increase the general revenue appropriation for fiscal year 2004 by

$710,000 and for fiscal year 2005 by $710,000, and adjust the totals

accordingly.

(7.) Direct the Legislative Budget Board staff to make

appropriate changes in Article III, page III-34, Rider 9,

Contingency Appropriation for School District Employee

Pass-Through, of the bill pattern for the Teacher Retirement

System, to indicate the revised pass-through amounts for teachers,

nurses, counselors, librarians, and support staff, based on an

equal distribution per employee of the increased funding.

2


