Amend Floor Amendment No. 4 to CSHB 3, as follows:

1. Strike provisions (2) - (7) (Amendment page 1, lines
14-19) ;

2. Section 45.003(d-1) (1) (A), Education Code, is amended by
striking "$1.30" and substituting "$1.31";

3. Section 45.003(d-1)(2) (A), Education Code, is amended by
striking "$1.25" and substituting "$1.27"; and

4. Section 45.003(e), Education Code, is amended to read as
follows:

"(e) An election held before January 1, 2005, authorizing a

maintenance tax at a rate of at least $1.31 on the $100 valuation of

taxable property in the district is sufficient to authorize a rate

of $1.31 or less for the 2005 tax year. An election held before

January 1, 2006, authorizing a maintenance tax at a rate of at least

$1.27 on the $100 valuation of taxable property in the district is

sufficient to authorize a rate of $1.27 or less for the 2006 tax

year . An election held before January 1, 2007, authorizing a

maintenance tax at a rate of at least $1.10 on the $100 valuation of

taxable property in the district is sufficient to authorize a rate

of $1.10 or less for the 2007 and subsequent tax years."




