
SENATE RESOLUTION NO. 570

WHEREAS, The Senate of the State of Texas is pleased to
welcome the members of the Leadership Mission Class 22 to the
State Capitol and to designate April 11, 2005, Leadership
Mission Day at the Capitol; and

WHEREAS, Leadership Mission is a nine-month educational
program founded in 1982 with the objective of identifying,
preparing, and motivating the City of Mission’s potential
leaders; and

WHEREAS, Participants in the Leadership Mission program
become better informed about city and county government, the
community’s health, economic, and education systems, and law
enforcement; they meet with community leaders to discuss
important issues and the challenges facing the community; for
the second year now, Leadership Mission has accepted students
from area high schools into the program, in addition to its
adult participants; and

WHEREAS, Since it was founded in 1982, Leadership Mission
graduates have gone on to become business and community leaders
who serve on boards and commissions and contribute to the
betterment of the City of Mission; Class 22 is the largest group
to participate in Leadership Mission since the organization ’s
inception; now, therefore, be it

RESOLVED, That the Senate of the State of Texas,
79th Legislature, hereby commend all those involved with
Leadership Mission for their dedication and commitment to their
community and extend best wishes for the future to all attending
Leadership Mission Day at the Capitol; and, be it further

RESOLVED, That a copy of this Resolution be prepared as an
expression of high regard from the Texas Senate.
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