
Amend the Amendment on page 187 of the pre-filed amendment

packet as follows:

(1) Strike "$10,000,000" in section (1), replacing with

"$7,500,000".

(2) In section (2) strike "$5,671,300", replacing with

"$671,300".

(3) In section (3), under letter d., strike "$37,226,325",

replacing with "$32,226,325". Also, strike "1,399 beds", replacing

with "1,209 beds".

1


