
Amend CSSB 1, under Article VIII as follows:

(1) On page VIII-81, C.1.1. Strategy: Energy Assistance,

strike "$114,000,000" in 2010 and substitute "$104,875,000", and

strike "$117,000,000" in 2011 and substitute "$107,875,000".

(2) On page VIII-81, C.1.2. Strategy: Consumer Education,

strike "$2,875,000" in both years and substitute "$12,000,000".

(3) On page VIII-83, Rider 7, Allocation of System Benefit

Fund, on the Low Income Discount line item, strike "$114,000,000"

in 2010 and substitute "$104,875,000", and strike "$117,000,000" in

2011 and substitute "$107,875,000".

(4) On page VIII-83, Rider 7, Allocation of System Benefit

Fund, on the Customer Education line item, strike "$2,875,000" in

both years and substitute "$12,000,000".

(5) On page VIII-83, Rider 8, Low Income Discount, strike

"for 12 months" and substitute "during the months of May through

October in".

1


