
Amend CSHB 1 (house committee printing) as follows:

(1)AAIn Article VII of the bill, in the appropriations to the

Texas Workforce Commission, in A.2.1. Strategy: Skills Development

(page VII-36):

(A)AAamend the funding for the state fiscal year ending

August 31, 2012, by striking "$24,272,415" and substituting

"$22,325,280"; and

(B)AAamend the funding for the state fiscal year ending

August 31, 2013, by striking "$24,269,528" and substituting

"$22,322,392".

(2)AAIn Article III of the bill, in the appropriations to

Texas A&M University-San Antonio, in C.1.1. Strategy: Transition

Funding (page III-85):

(A)AAamend the funding for the state fiscal year ending

August 31, 2012, by striking "$5,682,849" and substituting

"$7,629,984"; and

(B)AAamend the funding for the state fiscal year ending

August 31, 2013, by striking "$5,682,849" and substituting

"$7,629,985".

(3)AAAdjust totals and methods of finance accordingly.

1


