
Amend SBA16 on third reading as follows:

(1)AAIn SECTION 1 of the bill, in added Section

55.1781(a)(12), Education Code, strike "$40 million" and

substitute "$45 million".

(2)AAIn SECTION 1 of the bill, in added Section

55.1781(a)(13), Education Code, strike "$56 million" and

substitute "$63 million".

(3)AAIn SECTION 1 of the bill, in added Section

55.1785(a)(3), Education Code, strike "$56 million" and substitute

"$63 million".

1


