© 0 9 0 U b W

10
11
12
13
14
15
le6
17

JU A

ARLrE N oA,
12y 28 g 203

DRE AT DTS e TATIVER
ACUSE 0F RED . 2R TATIVES

FLOOR AMENDMENT NO. BY: }j\ (;OﬁiiQ&E

Amend C.S.S.B. No. 1 (house committee printing) as follows:
(1) In Article III of the bill, in the appropriations to the
Texas Education Agency, in Strategy B.1l.1, Assessment &
Accountability System (page III-2), amend the funding as follows:
(A) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2014,
strike "$45,931,837" and substitute "$0"; and
(B) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2015,
strike "$45,931,837" and substitute "$0".
(2) In Article III of the bill, in the appropriations to the
Texas Education Agency, in Strategy B.2.1,
Technology/Instructional Materials (page III-2), amend the funding
as follows:
(A) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2014,
strike "$423,335,208" and substitute "$469,267,045"; and
(B) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2015,
strike "$423,335,208" and substitute "$469,267,045".

(3) Adjust totals and methods of financing appropriately.

83R18398 CAE-D 1



