s w N

X [e0] ~J o (S

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17

18

830621

(@3]

o
2
[
[¥%}
s
[
i
wr

LM SA—

FLOOR AMENDMENT NO.

Amend C.S.S.B. 1 (house committee printing) as follows:

(1) In Article VI of the bill, in the appropriations to the
Commission on Environmental Quality, in Strategy C.1.3, Pollution
Prevention Recycling (page VI-15), amend the funding as follows:

(pA) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2014,
strike "$2,262,755" and substitute "$0"; and

(B) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2015,
strike "$2,262,755" and substitute "so".

(2) In Article III of the bill, in the appropriations to the
Teacher Retirement System, in Strategy A.2.1, Retiree Health -
Statutory Funds (page III-27), amend the funding as follows:

(p) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2014,
strike "$247,531,484" and substitute "$249,794,239"; and

(B) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2015,
strike "$247,531,484" and substitute "$249,794,239".

(3) Strike Rider 6 following the appropriations to the
Commission on Environmental Quality (page VI-19).

(4) Adjust totals and methods of financing appropriately.

83R19294 JTS-D 1



