G

30693

FLOOR AMENDMENT NO. BY: jC /‘é@w&u

Amend C.S.S.B. No. 1 as follows:
1) In Article I of the bill on page I-51, add the following new Rider

Defense Economic Adjustment Assistance Grant Program. From the funds
appropriated above in Strategy A.1.10, the Trusteed Programs Within the Office of the Governor
shall allocate $20,000,000 for the 2014-15 biennium in General Revenue funds for the purpose
of providing Defense Economic Adjustment Assistance Grants to defense communities. The
Texas Military Preparedness Commission shall administer the Defense Economic Adjustment
Assistance Grant program.

2) In Article I of the bill on page I-51, for Strategy A.1.10, MILITARY PREPAREDNESS, for
Fiscal Year 2014, strike “$124,103,995” and substitute “$144,103,995”.

3) In Article I of the bill on page 51-2, for Strategy A.1.3, CRIMINAL JUSTICE, for Fiscal
Year 2014, strike “$96,853,289” and substitute “$76,853,289”.



