Amend CSHB 1 (house committee printing) in Article XI, in the
Article I appropriations to the Comptroller of Public Accounts
(page XI-1), as follows:

(1) In the item "Local Telephone Exchanges", strike the sum
"$1,000,000" and substitute "$2,000,000".

(2) In the item "Rural Scholarship Fund", strike the sum

"$1,000,000" and substitute "$2,000,000".



