
Amend Amendment No.A____ by Minjarez to CSHBA3396 as follows:

(1)AAOn page 1, in SECTION 1 of the amendment, in the heading

to amended Section 254.261, Election Code, strike "$104.35" and

substitute "$500".

(2)AAOn page 1, in SECTION 2 of the amendment, in amended

SectionA254.261(a), Election Code, strike "$104.35" and substitute

"$500".

1


