
Amend CSHBA1 (house committee printing) as follows:

(1)AAIn the Article I appropriations to the Trusteed Programs

within the Office of the Governor, reduce the appropriation from

general revenue for Strategy C.1.1, Create Jobs and Promote Texas

(page I-51), for the state fiscal year beginning September 1, 2019,

by $18 million.

(2)AAIn the introductory language to Rider 29 following the

Article IAappropriations to the Trusteed Programs within the Office

of the Governor (page I-57), strike "$365,032,288Ain All Funds" and

substitute "$347,032,288 in All Funds".

(3)AAIn Rider 29 following the Article I appropriations to

the Trusteed Programs within the Office of the Governor (page

I-57), in Paragraph (a), strike "$22,806,739" and substitute

"$4,806,739".

(4)AAIn the Article II appropriations to the Health and Human

Services Commission, increase the appropriations from general

revenue for Strategy D.1.1, Women’s Health Programs (page II-34),

by $9 million for each year of the state fiscal biennium.

(5)AAAdjust the totals and methods of financing accordingly.

1


