L3

FLOOR AMENDMENT Eggzﬁ 23 Bk ;3 BY: Zerwas

HOUSE-OF REPRESENTATIVES

Amend C.S.H.B. 1, as follows:

(1) On page XI-Xx add the following items with regards to the Texas Education Agency:

State Funding for Prekindergarten Classrooms - Rider $100,000,000
After-school Literacy Program - Rider . $1,000,000
Support for Military-Connected Children - Rider $1,000,000
Texas Science Technology Engineering and Mathematics
And Medical Education (T-STEM+M) - Rider Revision $1,000,000
Grants for Pre-K Services at Intergenerational Facilities - Rider $1,500,000
After-school Literacy Program - Rider $1,000,000
Advanced Placement Initiative - Rxder Revxsmn ' $2,200,000
Amachi - Rider Revision - $2,700,000
Educator Quality and Leadership - Rider Revision $20,000,000
Educator Quality and Leadership - Rider Revision ' $20,000,000
Supporting Secondary Exit-Level Assessment Options - Rider $20,000,000
‘Rapid Property Value Decline - Rider Revision $25,000,000
Children’s Learning Institute - Rider Revisions $7,000,000
Interstate Education Compact Fees - Rider $640,000
Special Education Strategic Plan - Rider Revision $43,750,000
Funding for Special Education Strategic Plan FTEs — Rider Revision $5,000,000
Quality Physical Education Training Grants - Rider - ~ $1,000,000
Grants to Support the Needs of Students Experiencing _
Homelessness - Rider ~ $6,000,000

. Oversight of Open-Enrollment Charter Schools - Rider $750,000
Texas Gateway and Online Services - Rider Revision $8,000,000
Contingency for House Bill 3: Increases to Adult Charter
School — Rider
Contingency for House Bill 1051 - Rider
Contingency for House Bill 129 - Rider $161,000
Contingency for House Bill 18 - Rider $503,206
Contingency for House Bill 19 - Rider $5,000,000

Contingency for House Bill 231 - Rider

Contingency for House Bill 272 - Rider

Contingency for House Bill 2824 - Rider ,, $4,000,000
Funding for Bleeding Control Stations/Tourniquet Kits - Rider $20,000,000
Educator Quality and Leadership — Rider Revision

Contingency for House Bill 1051 - Rider

Funding for the Early Childhood Intervention Services - Rider

Contingent Appropriation Providing fora Technology

Taskforce - Rider

Contingency for House Bill 2819 - Rider $4,000,000
Contingency for School Safety Allotment - Rider $516,269,350
Texas Safe and Healthy Schools Initiative - Rider $45,000,000

Foundation Scheol Program Transfer Authority for Individuals
With Disabilities Education Act State Maintenance of
Financial Support — Rider

Contingent Appropriation for School District Surcharge
Reimbursement Program for Hiring Retired Special

Education Personnel — Rider



(2) On page ITI-206, with regards to Rider 18 of the Public Community/Junior Colleges bill
pattern, strike “Student transfers to a General Academic Institution after successfully
completing at least 15 semester credit hours at the institution” and substitute “Student
transfers to a General Academic Institution after successfully completing at least 15
semester crédit hours at the community college, or a student in a structured co-enrollment
program successfully completing at least 15 SCH at the community college”.

(3} On Page VIII-5, with regards to the Schedule of Exetﬁpt Positions, Executive Director,
Group 2, within the Board of Chiropractic Examiners bill pattern, strike “$98,000” and
substitute “$106,137” for each year of the biennium.

(4) On Page VIII-25, with regards to the Schedule of Exempt Positions, Executive Director,
Group 6, within the Department of Licensing and Regulation bill pattern, strike
“$180,593” and substitute “$190,000” for each year of the biennium.

(5) On Page VIII-52, with regards to the Schedule of Exempt Positions, Executive Director,
Group 5, within the Public Utility Commission of Texas bill pattern, strike “$174,048”
and substitute “$200,000” for each year of the biennium.



