
 1   

FLOOR AMENDMENT NO._____ BY:  _______________ 

<EOH> 

Amend CSSB 1 (house committee report) as follows: 1 

(1) In the Article I appropriations to the Trusteed Programs 2 

within the Office of the Governor, reduce the appropriation from 3 

general revenue for C.1.1. Strategy: CREATE JOBS AND PROMOTE TEXAS 4 

(page I-53), for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2022 5 

($270,462,198) by $20 million. 6 

(2) In the introductory language to Rider 27 following the 7 

Article I appropriations to the Trusteed Programs within the Office 8 

of the Governor (page I-59), strike "$322,004,270 in All Funds" 9 

and substitute "$302,004,270 in All Funds". 10 

(3) In Rider 27 following the Article I appropriations to 11 

the Trusteed Programs within the Office of the Governor (page I-12 

59), in Paragraph (c), strike "$100,000,000" and substitute 13 

"$80,000,000". 14 

(4) In the Article II appropriations to the Health and Human 15 

Services Commission, increase the appropriations from general 16 

revenue for D.1.2. Strategy: ALTERNATIVES TO ABORTION (page II-17 

33) by: 18 

a. $10 million for the state fiscal year ending August 19 

31, 2022; and 20 

b. $10 million for the state fiscal year ending August 21 

31, 2023. 22 

(5) Adjust the totals and methods of financing accordingly. 23 

21 Apr-19 AM 09:29
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

BY: Vasut


